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Features

Front Panel



Rear Panel



Remote Control Layout

You can control the touchscreen display in several ways:

1. Using the remote control.

2. Using the physical buttons on the display.

3. Using the on-screen display menus and touch input.



Initial Setup

Wi-Fi Antenna Connection

After mounting the unit securely to the included mobile stand or a wall mount, connect the included Wi-Fi
antennas to the rear of the unit. The four larger antennas connect to the lower connectors, and the two smaller
antennas connect to the upper connectors.



Camera Connection

Clip the included HD webcam to the top of the display. You can reposition it as needed. Using the included USB
cable, connect the webcam to the camera input at the rear of the unit.

Remote Control Setup

Insert the included AAA batteries into the included remote control. Follow the polarity (+/-) indicated in the battery
compartment.

Power Connection

Connect one end of the included AC input power cord to the unit’s C14 inlet. Connect the plug to a grounded
120V AC outlet on the included battery system. If you are not using the battery system, connect the plug directly to
a properly grounded 120V 15A AC wall outlet. The master on/off switch next to the C14 inlet must be in the “on”
position for the unit to function. Set the master on/off switch to the “off” position if the unit will be idle for more than
a few days.

Initial Display (Android) Startup

Press the power button on the front of the unit or the remote control. After a brief startup sequence, the unit will be
ready to use. Select “menu” and enter the wireless network settings for your location. If you are unsure how to do
this, contact your IT department for the correct network settings.

Refer to the Owner’s Manual for more information.

Warranty & Product Registration

2-Year Limited Warranty

Seller warrants this product, if used in accordance with all applicable instructions, to be free from original defects
in material and workmanship for a period of 2 years from the date of initial purchase. If the product should prove
defective in material or workmanship within that period, Seller will repair or replace the product, in its sole
discretion.

THIS WARRANTY DOES NOT APPLY TO NORMAL WEAR OR TO DAMAGE RESULTING FROM ACCIDENT,
MISUSE, ABUSE OR NEGLECT. SELLER MAKES NO EXPRESS WARRANTIES OTHER THAN THE
WARRANTY EXPRESSLY SET FORTH HEREIN. EXCEPT TO THE EXTENT PROHIBITED BY APPLICABLE



LAW, ALL IMPLIED WARRANTIES, INCLUDING ALL WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY OR FITNESS,
ARE LIMITED IN DURATION TO THE WARRANTY PERIOD SET FORTH ABOVE; AND THIS WARRANTY
EXPRESSLY EXCLUDES ALL INCIDENTAL AND CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES. (Some states do not allow
limitations on how long an implied warranty lasts, and some states do not allow the exclusion or limitation of
incidental or consequential damages, so the above limitations or exclusions may not apply to you. This warranty
gives you specific legal rights, and you may have other rights which vary from jurisdiction to jurisdiction.)

WARNING: The individual user should take care to determine prior to use whether this device is suitable,
adequate or safe for the use intended. Since individual applications are subject to great variation, the
manufacturer makes no representation or warranty as to the suitability or fitness of these devices for any specific
application.

Product Registration

Visit tripplite.com/warranty today to register your new Tripp Lite product. You’ll be automatically entered into a
drawing for a chance to win a FREE Tripp Lite product!*

* No purchase necessary. Void where prohibited. Some restrictions apply. See website for details.

Regulatory Compliance

Regulatory Compliance Identification Numbers: For the purpose of regulatory compliance certifications and
identification, your Tripp Lite product has been assigned a unique series number. The series number can be found
on the product nameplate label, along with all required approval markings and information. When requesting
compliance information for this product, always refer to the series number. The series number should not be
confused with the marketing name or model number of the product.

FCC Specifications for Models with FCC Class A Approval:
This device complies with part 15 of the FCC Rules. Operation is subject to the following two conditions: (1) This
device may not cause harmful interference, and (2) this device must accept any interference received, including
interference that may cause undesired operation.

Note: This equipment has been tested and found to comply with the limits for a Class A digital device, pursuant to
part 15 of the FCC Rules. These limits are designed to provide reasonable protection against harmful interference
when the equipment is operated in a commercial environment. This equipment generates, uses, and can radiate
radio frequency energy and, if not installed and used in accordance with the instruction manual, may cause
harmful interference to radio communications. Operation of this equipment in a residential area is likely to cause
harmful interference in which case the user will be required to correct the interference at his own expense. The
user must use shielded cables and connectors with this equipment. Any changes or modifications to this
equipment not expressly approved by Tripp Lite could void the user’s authority to operate this equipment.

Tripp Lite has a policy of continuous improvement. Specifications are subject to change without notice. Photos and
illustrations may differ slightly from actual products.

1111 W. 35th Street, Chicago, IL 60609 USA • tripplite.com/support

http://tripplite.com/support
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