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Illumination

Memphis ow was designed to bring fun energy to any situation. The dancing LED lighting can be turned on by
pressing the LED button. If you are looking for a more relaxed listening experience, the lights can by turned OFF
by pressing the button again.

Linking 2 Flows with MLINKTM

At Memphis we are all about more sound! The Memphis Flow is designed with MLINKTM Technology which
allows you to easily pair with a second Memphis ow (sold separately) to simultaneously stream music to two
devices at once in stereo. MLINKTM brings your listening experience to the next level, simply power on both
Memphis Flow devices. Short press the MLINKTM Pairing button on both devices, the devices will pair together.
Begin streaming your music and enjoy.

Technical Info

Bluetooth version�5.0 Bluetooth protocol: HFP A2DP AVRCP Speaker�4 20W x 2 Rated power�RMS
40W(THD=1%) Frequency response: 120Hz~16KHz Support�Bluetooth�AUX in�MLINKTM,Power bank Bluetooth
Range: 33 feet(10m) Compatibility: IOS/Android

Warranty

Memphis Flow Devices are warrantied for 1 year from date of purchase. All warranty inquires must contact
customer service at:

800.489.2300 customerservice@memphiscaraudio.com www.memphiscaraudio.com

Memphis Flow

Memphis Audio has been bringing massive sound to cars, boats and powersports vehicles for decades. You can
now bring the exciting energy of Memphis Audio anywhere you go with the Memphis Flow Wireless Bluetooth
Speaker. This powerful device can crank massive sound anywhere you go. The IPX7 rating allows this device to
continue to play in wet environments making it ideal for the pool, beach, or any other outdoor activity. Select either
Bluetooth or AUX playback to stream your favorite music for up to 15 hours on a single charge! Need more sound
to keep the party going? No problem, pair 2 Memphis ow speakers together with MLINKTM quick pair technology.
Memphis ow speakers are also equipped with LED accent lights which dance to the music along with an ultra-cool
illuminated speaker strobe light effect making the Memphis ow the ultimate party speaker when the lights go
down.

Features
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BLUETOOTH STREAMING & AUX CONNECTIONS Enjoy your favorite content via Bluetooth streaming or 3.5mm
jack.
POWERFUL BATTERY FOR EXTENDED PLAYBACK TIME 7200m Lithium ion battery provides 15 hours of
playtime & charges via USB port.
IPX7 WATERPROOF Memphis Flow speakers are perfect for the pool or other wet environments MLINKTM
PAIRABLE SPEAKER DESIGN Wirelessly pair 2 speakers together with MLINKTM Technology RUGGED
CONSTRUCTION High-impact, rugged materials are designed to provide worry-free adventuring. POWERBANK
ACCESSORY CHARGING Charge accessories and devices from your Memphis Flow via 1A power bank.
MBASSTM RADIATOR FOR ENHANCED MID BASS Dual passive radiators deliver impressive mid bass and loud
clear sound
DIMENSIONS:

What’s In The Box?

1 Memphis Flow True Wireless Bluetooth Speaker

1 USB-C Charging Cable

1 AUX cable

User Manual

Button Function

Charging

For best results Memphis recommends charging the Memphis Flow fully before your rst use. Simply plug in the
provided USB-C charging cable into an appropriate USB outlet. Plug the USB-C into the Memphis Flow. The LED
indicator light will illuminate RED while charging. Once charge is complete, the device will illuminate GREEN.

Pairing Your Flow



1. Press and hold the power button to turn the device ON (Solid White Light)

2. On your phone or Bluetooth device, switch your Bluetooth ON and search for available Bluetooth devices.

3. On your Memphis Flow long press the Bluetooth Button to make the device discoverable.

4. On your phone or other Bluetooth Device, MEMPHIS FLOW should appear. Select MEMPHIS FLOW and your

device will pair.

5. Once paired the light will illuminate SOLID BLUE.
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