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Gemüseschneider Slicer and Dicer Mandoline Multifonction

Congratulations!
You have chosen to purchase a high-quality product. Familiarise yourself with the product before using it for the
first time.

 Read the following instructions for use carefully.
Use the product only as described and only for the given areas of application. Store these instructions for use
carefully. When passing the product on to third parties, please also hand over all accompanying documents.
Scope of delivery/
Parts list (fig. A)
1 x multi-functional chopper: collecting tray (1a) hinged lid, detachable (1b) holder for food remnants (2) cleaning
comb (3) holder for attachments (4) storage lid (5) cube attachment, cutting grid small (6) cube attachment, cutting
grid large (7) attachment for thick slices/wedges (8) julienne attachment (9) grating attachment (10) attachment for
thin slices (11) 1 x instructions for use

Technical data

Dimensions: approx. 27.5 x 11 x 10.8cm (l x w x h)

 Date of manufacture (month/year): 09/2024
Intended use
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This product has been developed for chopping up food. The product is not suitable for chopping up frozen foods,
stones, pips, seeds etc. The product is only for private and not for commercial use.

 Suitable for food

 Dishwasher-safe

 BPA-free (no bisphenol A)

Safety instructions

 Danger to life!

Never leave children unsupervised with the packaging material. Risk of suffocation.

 Risk of injury!

Keep children away from the product.

The product contains sharp components. Be sure not to injure yourself.

Do not hold the attachments by the blades or cutting edges. The blades are very sharp.

Never use your hands to squeeze food through the cutting knife.

When slicing or grating, use the food rem- nants holder to prevent injury.

Do not make any modifications to the product!

Use the product exclusively for its intended use.

Before using the product check for correct stability.

Place the product on a level and stable surface.

Remove food remnants from the attachments only with the cleaning comb and/or with a dish-washing brush.

Risk of injury from sharp blades!

The product is not break-proof. Do not use the product if it is damaged.

Check the product for damage and wear before each use. The product may be used only when in good working

order and condition!

No liability results from accidents that occur because of disregard for the safety instructions above or because

of improper handling.

 Risk of trapped fingers!

Caution! When snapping shut and during use, mind your fingers especially since there is a risk of crushing or

cutting them.

 Avoiding material damage!

The product is not suitable for cutting up hard objects.

Do not use the product either for deep-frozen food or for food containing bones, fish bones, pips, seeds or

stones.

Do not apply force if the hinged lid will not fully close. Otherwise this may damage the product.



Keep a sufficient distance away from heat sources (e.g. stove tops) and open flame to prevent damaging the

product.

Use
 CAUTION. Risk of injury! Do not hold the attachments by the blades or cutting edges. The blades are very

sharp.
Note: Whenever possible use the food remnants holder (2) to hold smaller pieces of food securely in place. This
helps to avoid injuries, particularly when using the julienne attachment (9), the grating attachment (10) or the
attachment for thin slices (11).
Note: The product must be cleaned after use each time. Use the cleaning comb (3) to clean the pressure plate of
the hinged lid (1b).
Note: Some foods contain strong natural colourants that can cause discolouration of plastic parts. This does not
affect their function.
Attachments (6-8)
For cutting up soft foods such as eggs, sausage and cooked vegetables.
Note: Before using, cut the food into slices of the desired thickness. Make sure that there is enough space around
the cutting surfaces so that food cannot get caught on the edge of the knife.

1. Lift the hinged lid (1b) and place the holder for the attachments (4) on the collecting tray (1a).

2. Take the desired attachment and position it in the holder until it snaps in.

Note: Use the recess in the holder in order to take the attachment out.

3. Lay the food on the cutting surface and press the hinged lid down.

Note: If the hinged lid does not fully close, do not apply force to press it down. The product may otherwise

become damaged.

Julienne attachment (9)
For slicing foods such as potatoes, carrots and cucumbers into thin strips.
Grating attachment (10)
For grating foods such as potatoes, carrots, cucumbers, radishes and cheese.
Attachment for thin slices (11)
For slicing foods such as potatoes, cucumbers and radishes.
Removing the hinged lid

1. Raise the hinged lid (1b) into the vertical position.

2. Remove the holder for the attachments (4) from the collecting tray (1a).

3. Hold the collecting tray firmly with one hand and pull the hinged lid upwards to remove it.

Storage, cleaning
When not in use, always store the product clean and dry at room temperature.
Clean the product thoroughly before using it the first time. Clean the product in the dishwasher or with water and a
mild detergent.
IMPORTANT! Never clean the product with harsh cleaning agents.
Disposal

 Dispose of the product and packaging materials in accordance with current local regulations. Store the
packaging materials (foil bags, for example) out of the reach of children. For further information about disposal of
the product no longer needed, contact your local council. Dispose of the product and the packaging in an
environmentally friendly manner.

 The Recycling Code distinguishes different materials to be returned for recycling. The Code consists of the
recycling symbol for the recycling process and a number that identifies the material.
Notes on the guarantee and service handling
The product was produced with great care and under continuous quality control. DELTA-SPORT



HANDELSKONTOR GmbH gives private end customers a three-year guarantee on this product from the date of
purchase (guarantee period) in accordance with the following provisions. The guarantee is only valid for material
and manufacturing defects. The guarantee does not cover parts that are subject to normal wear and tear and that
are thus considered wear parts (e.g. batteries) and it does not cover fragile parts such as switches or parts that are
made of glass. Claims under this guarantee are excluded if the product has been used incorrectly, improperly, or
contrary to the intended purpose, or if the provisions in the instructions for use were not observed, unless the end
customer proves that a material or manufacturing defect exists that was not caused by one of the aforementioned
circumstances. Claims under the guarantee can only be made within the guarantee period by presenting the
original sales receipt. Please therefore keep the original sales receipt. The guarantee period is not extended by
any repairs carried out under the guarantee, under statutory guarantees, or as a gesture of goodwill. This also
applies to replaced and repaired parts. If you wish to make a claim please first contact the service hotline
mentioned below or contact us by e-mail. If there is a guarantee case, then the product will be repaired or replaced
free of charge to you or the purchase price will be refunded, depending on our choice. There are no further rights
from the guarantee. Your legal rights, in particular guarantee claims against the respective seller, are not limited by
this guarantee.

IAN: 462703_2404
Service Great Britain
Tel.: 0800 404 7657

E-Mail: deltasport@lidl.co.uk
Service Ireland

Tel.: 1800 101010
E-Mail: deltasport@lidl.ie

DELTA-SPORT HANDELSKONTOR GMBH
Wragekamp 6

22397 Hamburg
GERMANY 09/2024

Delta-Sport-№: MF-14539

www.lidl-service.com
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