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OPERATING INSTRUCTIONS

TRANSMITTER MODE (TX)

The transmitter mode (TX) lets you transmit audio from a non-Bluetooth device (e.g., an airplane screen or gym
equipment) to a Bluetooth device (e.g. headphones).

1. Turn off Bluetooth on your cell phone.

2. Connect the adapter to the non-Bluetooth device (e.g. airplane screen or gym equipment).

3. Make sure the adapter’s switch is on TX.

4. Press and hold the button for 3 seconds to turn on the adapter (the Bluetooth indicator will flash red/blue.

5. Turn on the Bluetooth device (e.g. headphones). The device will automatically pair with the adapter within a few

seconds. Once paired, the Bluetooth indicator will flash blue for 3 seconds.

RECEIVER MODE (RX)

The receiver mode (RX) lets you receive audio from a Bluetooth device (e.g. phone or tablet) and transmit it to a
non-Bluetooth device with an AUX-in port (e.g. car or home speaker).

1. Make sure the adapter’s switch is on RX.

2. Press and hold the button for 3 seconds to turn on the adapter (the Bluetooth Indicator will flash red/blue).

3. Turn on your Bluetooth device (e.g. phone) and make sure Bluetooth is turned on. Please search and pair the

device to ConairTS282. Once paired, the Bluetooth indicator will flash blue for 3 seconds. After pairing

successfully, plug the adapter’s AUX Plug into the AUX-In port of the non-Bluetooth device.

NOTE: If pairing isn’t achieved within 15 minutes, the adapter will turn off.

OPERATION GUIDE



GETTING TO KNOW YOUR BLUETOOTH WIRELESS AUDIO ADAPTER

Product Overview



SPECIFICATIONS

Bluetooth version: Bluetooth 5.4

Bluetooth agreement: EDR

Charging current: 240mA Max.

Charging time (100%): 2 hours

Working voltage: 3.3-4.2V

Working current: RX: 25mA

TX: 50mA

Battery capacity: 250mAh

Charging port: USB-C

Unit size: 2.1 x 1.18 x 0.60 in.

Charging cable length: 11 in.

CHARGING INSTRUCTIONS

Fully charge the adapter prior to using itfor the first time, every 3 months, and when it hasn’t been used for a long
period of time. The red charging indicator will flash when the adapter needs to be charged.



1. Turn the adapter off, and connect it to a certified 5V USB power supply using a USB-C charging cable (not

included). The red charging indicator will light.

2. Once fully charged, the charging indicator will turn off.

Precaution: Do not use a USB power supply higher than 5V to charge the adapter.

INDICATOR LIGHTS

Pairing – Bluetooth Indicator flashes red/blue

Paired successfully – Bluetooth Indicator flashes blue

Low power – Red Charging Indicator flashes

BATTERY SAFETY INFORMATION FOR RECHARGEABLE BATTERIES

1. This device contains a lithium battery pack.

2. Batteries are not to be removed by the consumer unless instructed by the manufacturer.

3. Since batteries are sensitive to high temperatures, when storing, keep the device in a cool dry place.

4. Never put batteries into a fire.

5. Switch off device after use.

6. Keep batteries away from children, especially batteries that are small enough to ingest.

7. If a battery is ingested, seek immediate medical attention. The National Battery Ingestion Hotline is available at

800-498-8666 or call the Poison Help Line at ( 800-222-1222).

8. Never open, crush, puncture or disassemble batteries.

9. Dispose of batteries according to any State and Local regulations.

10. Do not dispose of rechargeable batteries as solid waste.

11. The battery must be removed from the appliance before it is recycled.

12. This appliance must be disconnected from any power supply when removing the battery

RECYCLABLE BATTERY

Batteries may contain various materials that must be recycled and disposed of properly. Do not dispose of in the
municipal waste system.

Under various state and local laws, it is illegal to dispose of this battery in the municipal waste stream. The
EPAcertified RBRC™ battery recycling seal on the batteries indicates Conair is voluntarily participating in an
industry program to collect and recycle these batteries at the end of their useful life, when taken out of service in
the United States or Canada. The RBRC™ program provides a convenient alternative to placing the used
batteries in the trash or the municipal waste stream, which may be illegal in your area. Please call 1-800-8-
BATTERY™ for information. Battery recycling and disposal bans/restrictions in your area. Conair’s involvement in
this program is part of our commitment to preserving our environment and conserving our natural resources. Or
refer to the Call to Recycle link below for the nearest drop off location.
https://www.call2recycle.org/locator/

SUPPLIER’S DECLARATION OF CONFORMITY

Brand: Travel Smart® by Conair

Model No.: TS282XR

https://phone.gd/phone/800-498-8666
https://phone.gd/phone/800-222-1222
https://www.call2recycle.org/locator/


Description: Bluetooth Wireless Audio Adapter

Responsible Party: Conair LLC,

1 Cummings Point Road, Stamford,

CT 06902 203-351-9000

Standards: FCC Part 15 Subpart B, ANSIC63.4-2014.

DATE OF ISSUE: TBD

FCC Statement

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION NOTICE

WARNING: Changes or modifications to this unit not expressly approved by the party responsible for compliance
could void the user’s authority to operate the equipment. This device complies with Part 15 of the FCC Rules.
Operation is subject to the following two conditions:

1. This device may not cause harmful interference, and

2. This device must accept any interference received, including interference that may cause undesired operation.

NOTE: This equipment has been tested and found to comply with the limits for a Class B digital device, pursuant
to Part 15 of the FCC Rules. These limits are designed to provide reasonable protection against harmful
interference in a residential installation. This equipment generates, uses and can radiate radio frequency energy
and, if not installed and used in accordance with the instructions, may cause harmful interference to radio
communications. However, there is no guarantee that interference will not occur in a particular installation. If this
equipment does cause harmful interference to radio or television reception, which can be determined by turning
the equipment off and on, the user is encouraged to try to correct the interference by one or more of thefollowing
measures

Reorient or relocate the receiving antenna.

Increase the separation between the equipment and receiver.

Connect the equipment into an outlet on a circuit different from that to which the receiver is connected.

Consult the dealer or an experienced radio/TV technician for help.

FCC RADIATION EXPOSURE STATEMENT

This equipment complies with FCC radiation exposure limits set forth for an uncontrolled environment.

Limited Warranty

Limited Warranty (U.S. and Canada only)

Subject to the exclusions and limitations contained herein, Conair LLC (“Conair”) warrants that the Travel Smart®
by Conair Bluetooth Wireless Audio Adapter will be free from material defects in materials and workmanship under
normal home use conditions for a period of ONE (1) year beginning on the date the Product was purchased in its
original, sealed packaging, unless otherwise specified in this Limited Warranty. This Limited Warranty is only for
U.S. consumers (defined herein as purchasers at retail for personal, family, or household use) who originally
purchase the Product from Conair or an authorized Conair® reseller (if you are unsure whether a retailer or other
point of sale is an authorized or unauthorized Conair reseller, contact Conair).

This Limited Warranty does NOT cover:

https://phone.gd/phone/203-351-9000


Normal wear and tear;

Any Product purchased by commercial purchasers or for commercial or non-household uses;

Accessories, parts, or software added to the Product after the system is shipped from Conair;

Any costs associated with the replacement or repair of the Product, including labor, installation, or other costs

incurred by you without prior Conair approval;

Damage to the Product, defective conditions, or nonconformities due to: (1) external causes, including shipping,

accidents, problems with electrical power (Product designed for use with 120-volt outlets), abnormal conditions

(such as mechanical or environmental); (2) usage not in accordance with Product instructions; (3) misuse,

neglect, unauthorized alteration, unauthorized repair; and (4) acts of God or otherevents beyond Conair’s

control;

Though necessary repairs and maintenance might be performed by any company, damage caused by you or

any nonauthorized third party may void this Limited Warranty;

Damage caused by accessories orreplacement parts not specifically authorized by Conair may void this Limited

Warranty; and

Any Product where the original Product identification markings (trademark or serial number) have been

removed, altered, or obliterated from the Product.

It is recommended that you visit the website https://conair.registria.com for a fast, efficient way to complete your
product registration. However, product registration does not eliminate the need for the consumer to maintain the
original proof of purchase to obtain the warranty benefits. In the event that you do not have proof of purchase date,
the purchase date for purposes of this Limited Warranty will be the date of manufacture.

HASSLE-FREE WARRANTY

If the Product that is the subject of this Limited Warranty fails during the warranty period for reasons covered by
this Limited Warranty, Conair will, at its option, repair the Product or replace the Product with another identical or
reasonably equivalent product, or if Conair is unable to repair or replace the Product, refund the purchase price,
less the amount directly attributable to the consumer’s prior usage of the Product. To obtain a return shipping
label, email us at https://www.conair.com/ CustomerSupport?lang=en_US#cswarranty, or call our Consumer
Service Center toll-free at 1-800-3-CONAIR to speak with a representative. Upon receipt of the Product, Conair
will inspect the Product and, if required under this Limited Warranty, attempt to repair, replace, or refund the
Product within thirty (30) days. However, there may be delays beyond Conair’s control, in which case that time
period may be extended as reasonably necessary.
IMPORTANT: If the nonconforming Product is to be serviced by someone other than Conair’s Authorized Service
Center, please remind the servicer to call our Consumer Service Center at 1-800-3-CONAIR to ensure that the
problem is properly diagnosed, the Product is serviced with the correct parts, and the product is still under
warranty.

CALIFORNIA RESIDENTS ONLY

The ONE (1) year Limited Warranty period begins on the date the Product was delivered, which may be different
than the date the Product was purchased. California residents also have the option of obtaining the benefits of this
Limited Warranty by bringing the Product to (A) the store where it was purchased or (B) another retail store that
sells Conair products of the same type. The retail store shall then, according to its preference, either repair the
Product, refer the consumer to an independent repair facility, replace the Product with another identical or
reasonably equivalent product, or refund the purchase price less the amount directly attributable to the consumer’s
prior usage of the Product. California residents may also, according to their preference, return nonconforming
products directly to Conair for repair or, if necessary, replacement with another identical or reasonably equivalent
product by calling our Consumer Service Center toll-free at 1-800-3-CONAIR. Conair will be responsible for the
cost of such repair, replacement, and/or shipping and handling for such nonconforming products under warranty.

https://conair.registria.com
https://www.conair.com/


THIS LIMITED WARRANTY GIVES YOU SPECIFIC LEGAL RIGHTS, AND YOU MAY ALSO HAVE OTHER
RIGHTS THAT VARY FROM STATE TO STATE OR BY JURISDICTION. IN THE EVENT THIS LIMITED
WARRANTY IS BREACHED, YOU MAY HAVE CLAIMS FOR REPLACEMENT, DAMAGES, OR OTHER
PENALTIES. LIMITATIONS OF LIABILITY/ ADDITIONAL LIMITATIONS AND EXCLUSIONS ALL EXPRESS AND
IMPLIED WARRANTIES ARE LIMITED IN DURATION TO THE LIMITED WARRANTY PERIOD. NO
WARRANTIES APPLY AFTER THAT PERIOD. CONAIR’S RESPONSIBILITY UNDER THIS OR ANY OTHER
WARRANTY, IMPLIED OR EXPRESS, IS LIMITED TO REPAIR, REPLACEMENT, OR REFUND, AS SET FORTH
ABOVE. THESE REMEDIES ARE THE SOLE AND EXCLUSIVE REMEDIES FOR ANY BREACH OF WARRANTY.
TO THE MAXIMUM EXTENT PERMITTED BY LAW, CONAIR IS NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR ANY DIRECT,
INDIRECT, SPECIAL, INCIDENTAL, OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES RESULTING FROM ANY BREACH OF
WARRANTY OR UNDER ANY OTHER LEGAL THEORY (INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO, LOST PROFITS,
DOWNTIME, LOSS OF GOODWILL, DAMAGE TO OR REPLACEMENT OF EQUIPMENT AND PROPERTY, AND
ANY COSTS OF RECOVERING, REPROGRAMMING, OR REPRODUCING ANY PROGRAM OR DATA STORED
IN OR USED WITH A SYSTEM CONTAINING THE PRODUCT), EVEN IF CONAIR HAS BEEN ADVISED OF THE
POSSIBILITY OF SUCH DAMAGES. SOME STATES (OR JURISDICTIONS) DO NOT ALLOW THE EXCLUSION
OR LIMITATION OF INCIDENTAL OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES, SO THE ABOVE LIMITATIONS OR
EXCLUSIONS MAY NOT APPLY TO YOU. ALL EXPRESS AND IMPLIED WARRANTIES ARE LIMITED IN
DURATION TO THE LIMITED WARRANTY PERIOD. NO WARRANTIES APPLY AFTER THAT PERIOD. SOME
STATES (OR JURISDICTIONS) DO NOT ALLOW LIMITATIONS ON HOW LONG AN IMPLIED WARRANTY
LASTS, SO THIS LIMITATION MAY NOT APPLY TO YOU.

This Limited Warranty is issued by:

Conair LLC

1 Cummings Point Road

Stamford, CT 06902 1-800-3-CONAIR

Please register this product at  https://conair.registria.com.

Contact

Service Center

Conair LLC

Service Department

7475 North Glen Harbor Blvd.

Glendale, AZ 85307

www.conair.com

Customer Service: 1-800-3-CONAIR

Travel Smart® is a registered trademark of

Conair LLC

Travel Smart, a division of Conair LLC

Glendale, AZ 85307

©2025 Conair LLC

24FZ000022

FAQ

Q: What should I do if the adapter doesn’t pair within 15 minutes?

A: If pairing isn’t achieved within 15 minutes, the adapter will turn off. In this case, you can restart the

pairing process by turning on the adapter and your Bluetooth device again and initiating the pairing

https://conair.registria.com
http://www.conair.com
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