
Home » blooma » blooma Varennes Mains Powered Halogen Lamp User Guide 

Contents
1  blooma Varennes Mains Powered Halogen
Lamp
2  Instruction
3  Warranty
4  Documents / Resources

4.1  References
5  Related Posts

blooma Varennes Mains Powered Halogen Lamp

blooma Varennes Mains Powered Halogen Lamp User Guide

Manuals+ —  User Manuals Simplified.

https://manuals.plus/
https://manuals.plus/
https://manuals.plus/category/blooma
https://manuals.plus/blooma/varennes-mains-powered-halogen-lamp-manual.pdf


Instruction

This is a combined document. Please ensure that the instruction manual and safety manual are split out and
printed separately, including blank pages.

These instructions are for your safety. Please read through them thoroughly prior to installation and retain them for
future reference. Al fittings must be installed by a competent person in accordance with local regulations (lET
wiring regulation BS7671). Check the pack and make sure you have ll of the parts listed. Remove all packaging,
wrap etc. from the product. Decide on the appropriate location for your product.
CAUTION: IP44 is guaranteed when the product is properly installed and sealed. Always avoid the product to be
located at corrosive environment. Always refer to the installation drawing for the orientation of the product The
product must be securely fixed to the mounting surface using the screws and wall plugs supplied. The screws and
wal plugs supplied are suitable for “masonry” only. Other fixings not supplied and must be purchased. Take care
not to drily into any pipes or mains cables beneath the surface during mounting holes preparation.
IMPORTANT: The fixing point(s) selected must be capable of supporting the full weight of the light fitting. Wiring
diagram is for reference only. Always refer to the terminal marking for wiring. Ensure that all electrical connections
are tight and that no loose strands are left out of the terminal block. Never put anything on the product or hang
anything on any part of this product. Never use the terminal cables to bear the product weight. When the product
does not light after installation: >Ensure there is no electricity failure >Ensure all the connections are secured f you
have any doubt about instalation/use of this product, consult a qualified electrician. Aways disconnect the product
from mains at least 10 minutes allowing to cool down before any maintenance or adjustment. It is recommended
to have a regular schedule of care and maintenance to keep the surface condition wel.

Warranty

At Bloom, we devote special attention to selecting high-quality materials and use manufacturing techniques that
enable us to create designer and durable product ranges. That is why we offer a 2-year warranty against product
manufacturing defects. This product is under warranty for 2 years as from the date of purchase, for normal, non-
professional household use. The warranty shall only apply upon presentation of the till receipt or the invoice. Keep
your proof of purchase in a safe place. The warranty covers product breakdowns and malfunctions under the
condition that the product is used in accordance with its intended use and subject to installation and maintenance
in accordance with good practice and the information contained in the user’s manual. his product must be installed
so that it may be later removed without damaging it. This contractual warranty does not cover defects and



damage caused by the natural wear of parts, bad weather, flooding, heat releases, Treeing, damage caused by
water quality (hardness, aggressiveness, corrosion, etc.), by the presence of bodies transported by water and
damages De ne consequence or improper use. issue, negligence, accident or maintenance that is detective or
does not comply With good practice or the information in the user s manual. The following are als0 excluded from
the warranty: harmful consequences due to the use of accessories and/or non-original equipment manufacturer or
improper replacement parts, disassembly or product modification. The warranty is Immitted to those parts
recognized as defective, Under no circumstances shall it cover fringe expenses (travel, labour) and direct and
consequential damage. Guarantee related queries should be addressed to a store affiliated with the distributor
you purchased the product from. This guarantee is in addition to and does not affect your statutory rights.
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